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Energy and Electric Systems
•Turbine generators •Hydraulic turbine 
generators •Nuclear power plant equipment 
•Motors •Transformers •Power electronics 
equipment •Circuit breakers •Gas insulated 
switches •Switch control devices •Surveillance 
system control and security systems •Electrical 
equipment for locomotives and rolling stock 
•Elevators •Escalators •Particle beam treatment 
systems  •Others

•Programmable logic controllers •Inverters 
•Servomotors •Human-machine interface 
•Motors •Hoists •Magnetic switches •No-fuse 
circuit breakers •Short-circuit breakers 
•Transformers for electricity distribution •Time 
and power meters •Uninterruptible power supply 
•Industrial sewing machines •Computerized 
numerical controllers•Electrical-discharge 
machines •Laser processing machines 
•Industrial robots •Clutches •Car audio 
equipment •Car navigation systems •Automotive 
electrical equipment •Car electronics •Others

•Wireless communications equipment •Mobile 
handsets •Cable communications systems 
•Satellite communications equipment •Artificial 
satellites •Radar equipment •Antennas •Missile 
systems •Fire control systems •Broadcasting 
equipment •Data transmission devices 
•Information systems equipment •Systems 
integration •Others

•Power modules •High-frequency devices
•Optical devices •LCD devices •Printed circuit 
boards •System LSIs •Others

•Color televisions •Projection TVs •Display 
monitors •Video projectors •VCRs •DVDs 
•Room air conditioners •Package air 
conditioners •Refrigerators •Electric fans 
•Washing machines •Ventilators •Solar power 
generation systems •Hot water supply systems 
•Fluorescent lamps •Indoor lighting •Clean-air 
heaters •Compressors •Chillers •Humidifiers 
•Dehumidifiers •Air purifiers •Air-conditioning 
systems •Showcases •Cleaners •Microwave 
ovens •Others
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President

Mitsubishi Electric 
Corporation

Tokyo Building, 
2-7-3 Marunouchi, 
Chiyoda-ku, 
Tokyo 100-8310, Japan

January 15, 1921

¥175.8 billion
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Europe, Africa,
Middle East

Americas

Asia & Australia

Japan

Sales companies: 3
Manufacturing 
companies:       1
Other: 3
Total: 7

Sales companies: 3
Manufacturing
companies:       4
Research centers: 1
Other: 2
Total: 10Information and 

communication 
service companies: 4
Engineering service 
companies:               15
Manufacturing companies: 58
Sales companies: 46
Marketing companies: 2
     Total: 125

Sales companies: 17
Manufacturing
companies:      21
Other: 5
Total: 43
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